
 

 

Glenwood Care Facility, part of the Ensign Group, chooses to incorporate the Biodex Balance System SD 
into its Fall Risk Screening Program.   
 
February 19, 2014, Shirley, NY – Biodex Medical Systems is pleased to announce the addition of the 
Balance System SD into the Fall Risk Screening Program of Glenwood Care Facility, Oxnard, CA. 

Glenwood is a skilled nursing facility that provides short-term rehabilitation as well as long-term care. 
The goal at Glenwood is to provide patients with premier care and get them back home.  The numbers 
exemplify Glenwood’s success; 97% of those admitted to Glenwood either go home or to a lower level of 
care. 

Glenwood continually looks to improve its rehabilitation services with new techniques and technology.  
One of the areas of focus for changing the image of the facility was the way the rehabilitation process was 
being viewed.  “We were looking to move away from passive therapy to active therapy,” explains Dave 
Merkley, Executive Director of Glenwood.  The decision was made to add the Biodex Balance System 
SD to their rehabilitation program as part of this move in a new direction.   
 
Glenwood is using the Balance System SD to assess fall risk of both short-term and long-term patients.   
It is used out in the community at health fairs and at local assisted living facilities.  Future plans include 
promoting to the area physicians and hospital discharge planners in order to position Glenwood as the 
leading provider of Medicare-paid short-term inpatient rehabilitation in the area.   
 
To read about how Glenwood implemented the use of the Balance System SD into their Fall Risk 
Screening program and how it may apply to your facility download the full case study.   
 
To learn more about Biodex Physical Medicine & Rehabilitation Devices, contact Biodex directly at  
1-800-224-6339 (Int’l 631-924-9000), visit our website, www.biodex.com/rehab, or email us at 
info@biodex.com.   
 
About Biodex Medical Systems, Inc. 
Biodex Medical Systems, Inc. manufactures and distributes medical devices and related replacement parts 
for physical medicine, nuclear medicine and molecular imaging, and medical imaging applications. It also 
provides concussion management as well as fall risk screening and conditioning programs.  The Biodex 
commitment to innovative excellence spans more than 60 years. Our customer-driven support is why 
leading medical facilities around the globe call Biodex first. 
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